Grange, Juliane (she/her/hers)

From: Mahadasu Satyanarayana <Mahadasu.Satyanarayana@raincarbon.com>

Sent: Monday, March 27, 2023 5:32 PM

To: Heather Edgeworth; R5AirEnforcement; Smith, Robert H; r5hearingclerk

Cc: Ross Gares; Raghavendra Boorisetty; Randy McCaskill; Ryan Tayman

Subject: RE: Served Consent Agreement and Final Order for Rain Cll Carbon LLC (Robinson, lllinois)

CAA-05-2023-0012

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

Categories: Red Category

Good evening, Heather,
Thanks for the confirmation mail. Appreciate you and your team to make this happen before the due date.

| also want to thank once again Mr. Robert Smith and his team for their support.

Regards
Satya

From: Heather Edgeworth <Heather.Edgeworth@raincarbon.com>

Sent: Monday, March 27, 2023 5:23 PM

To: r5airenforcement@epa.gov; smith.roberth@epa.gov; rShearingclerk@epa.gov

Cc: Ross Gares <Ross.Gares@raincarbon.com>; Mahadasu Satyanarayana <Mahadasu.Satyanarayana@raincarbon.com>;
Raghavendra Boorisetty <Raghavendra.Boorisetty@raincarbon.com>; Randy McCaskill
<randy.mccaskill@raincarbon.com>; Ryan Tayman <Ryan.Tayman@raincarbon.com>

Subject: Served Consent Agreement and Final Order for Rain Cll Carbon LLC (Robinson, Illinois) CAA-05-2023-0012

Good afternoon,

Last week Rain Cll Carbon LLC released payment in the amount of $125,000 as instructed in the attached Consent
Agreement. Please find attached payment remittance as well for your records for payment made on 03/20/2023.

Regards,

Heather Edgeworth
Treasury Manager, North America

RAIN

RAIN CARBON INC.

Rain Cll Carbon LLC

1330 Greengate Drive, Suite 300
Covington, LA 70433

USA



985-635-3400 (office)
985-635-3443 (direct)

www.raincarbon.com




