
Caution: This email originated from outside EPA, please exercise additional caution when
deciding whether to open attachments or click on provided links.

From: r5hearingclerk
To: "Joseph Middleton"; King, Cynthia; R5AirEnforcement
Subject: RE: EPA Docket No. CAA-05-2024-0023; Andersen’s Sales & Salvage, Inc
Date: Thursday, May 30, 2024 7:35:00 AM

Good morning,
 
I received the Notice of Payment – thank you.
 
Juliane Grange
 
Juliane Grange
Regional Hearing Clerk
United States Environmental Protection Agency, Region 5
Phone 312-886-9868
 
 

From: Joseph Middleton <jmiddleton@middletonenvirolaw.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, May 29, 2024 7:14 PM
To: King, Cynthia <king.cynthia@epa.gov>; r5hearingclerk <r5hearingclerk@epa.gov>;
R5AirEnforcement <R5AirEnforcement@epa.gov>
Subject: EPA Docket No. CAA-05-2024-0023; Andersen’s Sales & Salvage, Inc

 

 
Please find the attached notice of payment in connection with the Consent Agreement and
Final Order referenced above.
 
Joseph G. Middleton
Middleton Environmental Law LLC
1355 S. Mesa Ct.
Superior, CO 80027
720.638.2021
jmiddleton@middletonenvirolaw.com
 
CONFIDENTIALITY NOTE:  This email message from the law office of Middleton Environmental Law LLC is for the sole use of the
intended recipient or recipients and may contain confidential and privileged information.  Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure,
distribution, or other dissemination of this email message and/or the information contained therein is strictly prohibited.  If you are not
the intended recipient of this email message, please contact the sender by reply email and destroy all copies of the original message
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