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From: Kory from Indy Painting
To: r5hearingclerk
Subject: Re: Filed and Served Consent Agreement and Final Order for Indy Enterprises, Inc. d/b/a Indy Painting (Mound,

Minnesota); Docket number: TSCA-05-2024-0001
Date:

Payment was sent via overnight Express Mail today.  See attachments as proof.  Please
confirm.

Thanks,

Kory Lidstrom
Founder, President
Indy Painting

www.IndyPainting.net
Office: 612-781-INDY
Direct: 612-865-8999

On 06-11-2023 1:56 pm, r5hearingclerk wrote:

I received your confirmation of receipt.
 
Thank you,
Juliane
312-886-9868
 

From: Kory from Indy Painting <kory@indypainting.net> 
Sent: Monday, November 6, 2023 2:19 PM
To: r5hearingclerk <r5hearingclerk@epa.gov>
Subject: Re: Filed and Served Consent Agreement and Final Order for Indy Enterprises, Inc. d/b/a
Indy Painting (Mound, Minnesota); Docket number: TSCA-05-2024-0001
 

 

Hi Juliane,

I got your email.  Will be sending out payment in the next day or two.

Thanks,

Kory Lidstrom
Founder, President
Indy Painting



www.IndyPainting.net
Office: 612-781-INDY
Direct: 612-865-8999

 

On 01-11-2023 12:32 pm, r5hearingclerk wrote:

Dear Mr. Lidstrom,

 

The attached Consent Agreement and Final Order, docket number TSCA-05-2024-0001,
was filed today with the Regional Hearing Clerk, U.S. EPA Region 5.  Also attached are a
cover letter and Certificate of Service.  Please confirm receipt of this email.

 

Thank you,

Juliane Grange

 

Juliane Grange

Regional Hearing Clerk

United States Environmental Protection Agency, Region 5

Planning and Administrative Staff

Enforcement and Compliance Assurance Division

Phone 312-886-9868

Email grange.juliane@epa.gov
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